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Participate in a public tender

Please select the buttons „Zum Portal“-
für Unternehmen [1] on our welcome
page. 

Here you are able to find a list of current
tenders. Search your tender by entering
one or more keywords in the search box 
or by narrowing down your search results
using filters [2].

As soon as you find a tender that might
be of interest, select the info-symbol on 
the right side [3]. Further information will 
be provided and can now be downloaded.

When logged in to your account, a 
current list of tenders can be found in the
menu item Verfahren [5]. Tenders that
you already participate in can be found
choosing meine Projekte.
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Being able to download all documents, 
messge the contracting authority
regarding upcoming questions, hand in 
tenders as well as staying up to date on 
any tender information, requires a free
registration on our website that enables
you to participate in tenders [4].
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